	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
	
	                    Inmate,  
	Uniforms,  Access.
	Mattresses,  Pillows  and
	Blankets

	Page 1 of 24 
	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	Lot 1
	
	
	
	
	

	A. Shirt, V-Neck, Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	    TriStitch or Equal:
	
	
	
	
	

	    Manufacturer:
	True Uniform
	Sportswear
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	    Item#
	
	
	
	
	

	A1. Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	4.35
	6.54
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 100 each
	435.00
	654.00
	
	
	

	A2. Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	4.35
	6.54
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	870.00
	1308.00
	
	
	

	A3. Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	4.35
	6.54
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	1740.00
	2616.00
	
	
	

	A4.X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	4.35
	6.54
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	1740.00
	2616.00
	
	
	

	A5.2XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	4.60
	6.54
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	1840.00
	2616.00
	
	
	

	A6. 3Xlarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	4.85
	6.81
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	1940.00
	2724.00
	
	
	

	A7. 4XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	5.10
	6.97
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2040.00
	2788.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
	
	                    Inmate,  
	Uniforms,  Access.
	Mattresses,  Pillows  and
	Blankets
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	A8. 5XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	5.35
	7.84
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2140.00
	3136.00
	
	
	

	A9. 6XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	5.60
	7.84
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2240.00
	3136.00
	
	
	

	A10. 7XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	5.85
	8.39
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2340.00
	3356.00
	
	
	

	A11. 8XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.10
	8.39
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	305.00
	419.50
	
	
	

	A12. 9XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.35
	8.42
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	317.50
	421.00
	
	
	

	A13. 10XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.60
	8.42
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	330.00
	421.00
	
	
	

	A14. 12XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.85
	10.23
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	342.50
	511.50
	
	
	

	A15. 14XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.10
	11.32
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	355.00
	566.00
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	B. Trousers, Pull-On, Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	    TriStitch or Equal:
	
	
	
	
	

	    Manufacturer: 
	True Uniform
	Sportswear
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	    Item#
	
	
	
	
	

	B1. Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	5.40
	7.26
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 100 each
	540.00
	726.00
	
	
	

	B2. Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	5.65
	7.26
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1130.00
	1452.00
	
	
	

	B3. Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	5.90
	7.26
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2360.00
	2904.00
	
	
	

	B4.X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.15
	7.26
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2460.00
	2904.00
	
	
	

	B5.2XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.40
	7.26
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2560.00
	2904.00
	
	
	

	B6. 3XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.65
	8.02
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2660.00
	3208.00
	
	
	

	B7. 4XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	6.90
	8.40
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2760.00
	3360.00
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
	
	                    Inmate,  
	Uniforms,  Access.
	Mattresses,  Pillows  and
	Blankets
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	B8. 5XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.15
	8.40
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2860.00
	3360.00
	
	
	

	B9. 6XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.40
	8.78
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	2960.00
	3512.00
	
	
	

	B10. 7XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.65
	9.21
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 400 each
	3060.00
	3684.00
	
	
	

	B11. 8XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.90
	9.86
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	395.00
	493.00
	
	
	

	B12. 9XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	8.15
	10.19
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	407.50
	509.50
	
	
	

	B13. 10XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	8.40
	10.63
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	420.00
	531.50
	
	
	

	B14. 12XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	8.65
	11.93
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	432.50
	596.50
	
	
	

	B15. 14XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	8.90
	13.13
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	445.00
	656.50
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	C. Shirt,  Short Sleeve, Poplin Light Blue-Bob Barker Co. #ZSP24LB or Equal


	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	Red Kap
	Imagewear
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	C1. Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.98
	8.83
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	399.00
	441.50
	
	
	

	C2. Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.98
	8.83
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 150 each
	1197.00
	1324.50
	
	
	

	C3. Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.98
	8.83
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 250 each
	1995.00
	2207.50
	
	
	

	C4.X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.98
	8.83
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 250 each
	1995.00
	2207.50
	
	
	

	C5.2XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	9.50
	9.24
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 250 each
	2375.00
	2310.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
	
	                    Inmate,  
	Uniforms,  Access.
	Mattresses,  Pillows  and
	Blankets
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	C6. 3XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	9.50
	9.24
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 250 each
	2375.00
	2310.00
	
	
	

	C7. 4XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	9.50
	9.24
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1900.00
	1848.00
	
	
	

	C8. 5XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	9.50
	9.24
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1900.00
	1848.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	D.  Jeans, Elastic Waist
	
	
	
	
	

	     Bob Barker #BDT or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	  Manufacturer
	True Uniform
	Sportswear
	
	
	

	  Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	D1. Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.19
	8.46
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 50 each
	359.50
	423.00
	
	
	

	D2. Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.19
	8.46
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 100 each
	719.00
	846.00
	
	
	

	D3.  Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.19
	8.46
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1438.00
	1692.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
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	Uniforms,  Access.
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	Blankets
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	D4. XL
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.19
	8.46
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1438.00
	1692.00
	
	
	

	D5. 2XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	7.76
	8.46
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1552.00
	1692.00
	
	
	

	D6.  4Xlarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	8.89
	9.71
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1778.00
	1942.00
	
	
	

	D7. 6XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	8.89
	10.52
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 200 each
	1778.00
	2104.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	E. T-Shirts, Bob Barker #683
	
	
	
	
	

	  Or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	  Manufacturer
	True Uniform
	Fruit of the Loom, Gildan or Jerzees
	
	
	

	  Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	E1. Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.25
	1.93
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	225.00
	347.40
	
	
	

	E2. Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.25
	1.93
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	225.00
	347.40
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
	
	                    Inmate,  
	Uniforms,  Access.
	Mattresses,  Pillows  and
	Blankets
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	E3. Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.25
	1.93
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 180 each
	225.00
	347.40
	
	
	

	E4.X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.25
	1.93
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	225.00
	347.40
	
	
	

	E5.2XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.90
	2.19
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	342.00
	394.20
	
	
	

	E6. 3XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.90
	2.54
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	342.00
	457.20
	
	
	

	E7. 4XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.73
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	450.00
	491.40
	
	
	

	E8. 5XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.86
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	450.00
	514.80
	
	
	

	E9. 6XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.00
	2.95
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	540.00
	531.00
	
	
	

	E10. 7XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.75
	5.74
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 48 each
	180.00
	275.52
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
	
	                    Inmate,  
	Uniforms,  Access.
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	Blankets
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	E11. 8XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.75
	6.30
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 48 each
	180.00
	302.40
	
	
	

	E12. 9XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.75
	7.03
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	135.00
	253.08
	
	
	

	E13. 10XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.75
	7.74
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	135.00
	278.64
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	F.  Boxers, Bob Barker #EBXLSQ
	
	
	
	
	

	  Or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	  Manufacturer
	True Uniform
	Rocky
	
	
	

	  Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	F1. Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.00
	.85
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 90 each
	90.00
	76.50
	
	
	

	F2. Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.00
	.85
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	180.00
	153.00
	
	
	

	F3. Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.00
	.85
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	180.00
	153.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	
	
	
	
	

	BID TABULATION
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	F4. X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.00
	.85
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 180 each
	180.00
	153.00
	
	
	

	F5.  2Xlarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.10
	.93
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	198.00
	167.40
	
	
	

	F6. 3Xlarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.20
	1.02
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	216.00
	183.60
	
	
	

	F7. 4XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.30
	1.10
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	234.00
	198.00
	
	
	

	F8. 5XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.40
	1.18
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	252.00
	212.40
	
	
	

	F9. 6 XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.50
	1.27
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	270.00
	228.60
	
	
	

	F10.  7XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.00
	1.43
	
	
	

	     Total Price for 180 each
	360.00
	257.40
	
	
	

	F11.  8Xlarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.00
	1.60
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	360.00
	288.00
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	F12. 9XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.00
	1.77
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 180 each
	360.00
	318.60
	
	
	

	F13. 10XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.00
	1.93
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	360.00
	347.40
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	G.  Panties, Women, Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	  #ELBLS Or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	  Manufacturer
	True Uniform
	Mighty Hugs
	
	
	

	  Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	G1. Size 5
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	.80
	.90
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	144.00
	162.00
	
	
	

	G2. Size 6
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	.80
	.90
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	144.00
	162.00
	
	
	

	G3. Size 7
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	.80
	.90
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	144.00
	162.00
	
	
	

	G4. Size 8
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	.80
	.90
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	144.00
	162.00
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	G5. Size 9
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	.90
	.95
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 180 each
	162.00
	171.00
	
	
	

	G6. Size 10
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	.90
	.95
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	162.00
	171.00
	
	
	

	G7.  Size 11
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.00
	1.00
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	180.00
	180.00
	
	
	

	G8.  Size 12
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.00
	1.00
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	180.00
	180.00
	
	
	

	G9.  Size 13
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.00
	1.00
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	180.00
	180.00
	
	
	

	G10.  Size 14
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.10
	1.08
	
	
	

	     Total Price for 180 each
	198.00
	194.40
	
	
	

	G11.  Size 15
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.10
	1.08
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 60 each
	66.00
	64.80
	
	
	

	G12.  Size 16
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.10
	1.08
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 60 each
	66.00
	64.80
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	H. Bra, Sports, Bob Barker #
	
	
	
	
	

	  #EBASPLS or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	  Manufacturer
	True Uniform
	Mighty Hugs
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	  Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	H1. 32 A & B
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.98
	1.82
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	356.40
	327.60
	
	
	

	H2. 34 A & B
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.98
	1.82
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	356.40
	327.60
	
	
	

	H3. 36 A & B
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.98
	1.82
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	356.40
	327.60
	
	
	

	H4. 38 A & B
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.98
	1.82
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	356.40
	327.60
	
	
	

	H5. 40 B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.98
	1.82
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	356.40
	327.60
	
	
	

	H6. 42  B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.20
	2.00
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	396.00
	360.00
	
	
	

	H7.  44  B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.20
	2.00
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	396.00
	360.00
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	H8. 46  B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.40
	2.18
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 180 each
	432.00
	392.40
	
	
	

	H9.  48 B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.40
	2.18
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	432.00
	392.40
	
	
	

	H10. 50  B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.75
	2.57
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	495.00
	462.60
	
	
	

	H11. 52  B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.75
	2.57
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	495.00
	462.60
	
	
	

	H12. 54  B, C, & D
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.00
	2.57
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	540.00
	462.60
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	I.  Bra, Cross Your Heart, Bob 
	
	
	
	
	

	  Barker, #EBANY
	
	
	
	
	

	  Manufacturer
	True Uniform
	Mighty Hugs
	
	
	

	  Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	I1. 32 A, B & C
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	1.80
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	324.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I2. 34 A, B, C & D
	
	
	
	
	

	   Unit Price
	1.80
	2.87
	
	
	

	   Total Price for 180 each
	324.00
	516.60
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	I3. 36 A, B, C, D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.25
	2.87
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 180 each
	405.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I4. 38 A, B, C, D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.25
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	405.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I5. 40 B, C, D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.25
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	405.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I6. 42  B, C, D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.25
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	405.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I7.  44  C, D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.25
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	405.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I8. 46  D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.25
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	405.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I9.  48 C, D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.25
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	405.00
	516.60
	
	
	

	I10. 50  D & DD
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.87
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 180 each
	450.00
	516.60
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	J.   Thermal Tops,  Bob Barker 
	
	
	
	
	

	    #63 or Equal:
	
	
	
	
	

	    Manufacturer:
	True Uniform
	Rocky
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	    Item#
	
	
	
	
	

	J1. Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
	
	
	

	 J2. Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
	
	
	

	  J3. Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
	
	
	

	J4. Xlarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
	
	
	

	J5. 2XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.75
	2.89
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	99.00
	104.04
	
	
	

	J6. 3XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.00
	3.14
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	108.00
	113.04
	
	
	

	J7. 4XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.25
	3.31
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	117.00
	119.16
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	J8. 5XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.50
	3.49
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	      Total Price for 36 each
	126.00
	125.64
	
	
	

	J9. 6XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	3.75
	3.74
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	135.00
	134.64
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	J10. 8XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	4.00
	4.55
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	144.00
	163.80
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	K. Bottoms, Thermal, Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	   #112 or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	  Manufacturer
	True Uniform
	Rocky
	
	
	

	  Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	K1.  Small
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
	
	
	

	K2.  Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
	
	
	

	K3. Large
	
	
	
	
	

	      Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	
	
	

	      Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	K4.  X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	2.50
	2.53
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Total Price for 36 each
	90.00
	91.08
	
	
	

	K5.  2X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	2.75
	2.89
	
	
	

	Total Price for 36 each
	99.00
	104.04
	
	
	

	K6.  3X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	3.00
	3.14
	
	
	

	Total Price for 36 each
	108.00
	113.04
	
	
	

	K7.  4X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	3.25
	3.31
	
	
	

	Total Price for 36 each
	117.00
	119.16
	
	
	

	K8.  5X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price 
	3.50
	3.49
	
	
	

	Total Price for 36 each
	126.00
	125.64
	
	
	

	K9.  6X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	3.75
	3.74
	
	
	

	Total Price for 36 each
	135.00
	134.64
	
	
	

	K10.  8X-Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	4.00
	4.55
	
	
	

	Total Price for 36 each
	144.00
	163.80
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	L.  Work Coat, Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	#652-BL or equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg. #
	True Uniform
	Sportswear
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	L1.  Medium 
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	21.00
	25.26
	
	
	

	Total Price for 50 each
	1,050.00
	1,263.00
	
	
	

	L2.  Large 
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	21.00
	25.26
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100 each
	2,100.00
	2,526.00
	
	
	

	L3.  XL
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	21.00
	25.26
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100 each
	2,100.00
	2526.00
	
	
	

	L4.  2XL
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	22.00
	25.68
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100 each
	2,200.00
	2568.00
	
	
	

	L5.  3XL
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	22.00
	26.76
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100 each
	2,200.00
	2676.00
	
	
	

	L6.  4XL
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	23.00
	26.76
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100 each
	2,300.00
	2676.00
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	L7.  6XL
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	23.00
	28.16
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Total Price for 100 each
	2,300.00
	2816.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	L8.  7XL
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	24.00
	29.24
	
	
	

	Total Price for 50 each
	1,200.00
	1462.00
	
	
	

	L9.  8XL
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	24.00
	29.57
	
	
	

	Total Price for 50 each
	1,200.00
	1478.50
	
	
	

	M.  X-Strap Thongs Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	#5114X or equivalent
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg. #
	True Uniform
	Shoe Corp.
	
	
	

	Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	M1.  Small
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	1.00
	1.53
	
	
	

	Total Price for 1200 pr.
	1,200.00
	1836.00
	
	
	

	M2.  Medium
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	1.00
	1.53
	
	
	

	Total Price for 3600 pr.
	3,600.00
	5508.00
	
	
	

	M3.  Large
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	1.00
	1.53
	
	
	

	Total Price for 3600 pr.
	3,600.00
	5508.00
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	M4.  XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	1.00
	1.53
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Total Price for 3600 pr.
	3,600.00
	5508.00
	
	
	

	M5.  2XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	1.00
	1.53
	
	
	

	Total Price for 3600 pr.
	3,600.00
	5508.00
	
	
	

	M6.  3XLarge
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	1.00
	1.53
	
	
	

	Total Price for 1200 pr.
	1,200.00
	1836.00
	
	
	

	N.  Steel Toe Leather Safety Boots
	
	
	
	
	

	Bob Barker #82221EE or equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg #.
	True Uniform
	Shoe Corp
	
	
	

	Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	N1. Size 6
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N2.  Size 6.5
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N3.  Size 7
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N4.  Size 7.5
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	1950
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1404.00
	1859.04
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	N5.  Size 8
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1,404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N6.  Size 8.5
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1,404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N7. Size  9
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1,404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N8.  Size 9.5
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 96 pr.
	1,872.00
	2478.72
	
	
	

	N9.  Size 10
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 96 pr.
	1872.00
	2478.72
	
	
	

	N10.  Size 10.5
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 96 pr.
	1872.00
	2478.72
	
	
	

	N11.  Size 11
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 96 pr.
	1872.00
	2478.72
	
	
	

	N12.  Size 12
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 96 pr.
	1872.00
	2478.72
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	N13.  Size 13
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N14.  Size 14
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	N15.  Size 15
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	19.50
	25.82
	
	
	

	Total Price for 72 pr.
	1404.00
	1859.04
	
	
	

	O.  Watch Cap, Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	#101N or equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg. #
	True Uniform
	Lombardy
	
	
	

	Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price

	1.00
	.76
	
	
	

	Total Price for 1500 each
	1500.00
	1140.00
	
	
	

	P.  Crew Socks-Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	#WC or equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg. #
	True Uniform
	Athletic World
	
	
	

	Item #
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	.40
	.48
	
	
	

	Total Price for 720 pr. each
	288.00
	345.60
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Total Bid Price Lot 1 (Items A-P)
	146,004.50
	183,663.12
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	ML CLICK MARKETING LLC
	OD TARAGIN & BROS., LLC.
	CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC
	BROOKE SUPPLIES
	COLONIAL TEXTILE LLC

	IFB NO.  14-9682-11YD
	
	
	
	
	

	BID DATE : 1-6-2015  3:00 pm 
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office
	
	
	
	
	

	LOT 2
	NO BID
	NO BID
	
	
	

	1.  Mattress “Flame Check”
	
	
	
	
	

	 Bob Barker #PJM25754 or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg #.
	
	
	
	
	

	Item #.
	
	
	DWVF452575XX
	BAMA25
	

	Unit Price
	
	
	27.88
	36.95
	0.00

	Total Price for 500 each
	
	
	13940.00
	18475.00
	0.00

	2.  Blanket, Woven Wool,
	
	
	
	
	

	90% Wool content, Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	#WB6690GY or equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg #
	
	
	
	
	

	Item #
	
	
	80WOO1CT
	PWB706690
	7210-00-205-2804

	Total Price for 1,500 each
	
	
	8.24
	6.60
	6.95

	3.  Blanket, “The Cozy” 
	
	
	12360.00
	9,900.0
	10,425.00

	Bob Barker #CZ6690GY or equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg. #
	
	
	
	
	

	Item #
	
	
	CUSTOMER MUST APPROVE SAMPLE
	HDPB6690
	7210-00-682

	Unit Price
	
	
	8.47
	5.10
	5.50

	Total Price for 500 each
	
	
	4235.00
	2550.00
	2750.00

	4. Pillow, ½ Size Bob Barker
	
	
	
	
	

	   #MV2013 Or Equal
	
	
	
	
	

	Mfg. #
	
	
	
	
	

	Item #
	
	
	UP13
	VPS
	

	Unit Price
	
	
	
2.87
	4.25
	0.00

	Total Price for 1,000 each
	
	
	2870.00
	4250.00
	0.00

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Total Bid Price Lot 2 (Items 1-4)
	
	
	33,405.00
	35,175.00
	13,175.00


