	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	IFB:   # 13-9489-10YD 
Annual Contract for Uniforms and Accessories

	BID TABULATION
	

	Page 1 of 3 
	BIDDERS

	IFB #13-9489-10YD
	Quality 

Uniforms
Co.
	Quality 

Uniforms

Co.
	Best Uniforms, Inc.
	Heroes Apparel,
LLC 
	
	

	BID DATE:  February 4, 2014 

TIME: 2:00 pm
	
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Item 1: Trousers, Female, Class A,  Fechheimer #X3903VAFW or Equal 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer 
	Special
	Special
	As Spec. 
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	VST-902
	VST-902
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$32.95
	$32.95
	$39.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 50
	$1,647.50
	$1,647.50
	$1,950.00
	
	
	

	Item 2: Trousers, Male, Class A,  Fechheimer #X3903VAF or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer 
	Special
	Special
	As Spec.
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	VST-902
	VST-902
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$32.95
	$32.95
	$39.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 300
	$9,885.00
	$9,885.00
	$11,700.00
	
	
	

	Item 3: Trousers, Male, Utility w/o Side Cargo pockets,  Class B Fechheimer #47419 or Equal 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer 
	Southeastern
	Horace Small
	As Spec.
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	3004
	HS2512
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$30.00
	$33.00
	$39.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 350
	10,500.00
	$11,550.00
	$13,650.00
	
	
	

	Item 4: : Trousers, Female, Utility w/o Side Cargo pockets, Class B, Fechheimer #47419W or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	Southeastern
	Horace Small
	As Spec
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	L3004
	HS2513
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$30.00
	$33.00
	$39.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 75
	$2,250.00
	$2,475.00
	$2,925.00
	
	
	

	Item 5: : Shirt, Short Sleeve, Men's,  Class A, Fechheimer #85R7884Z  or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	Horace Small
	Leventhal
	As Spec
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	HS1245
	999Z
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$28.75
	$30.00
	$34.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 250
	$7,187.50
	$7,500.00
	$8,500.00
	
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	IFB:   # 13-9489-10YD 
Annual Contract for Uniforms and Accessories

	BID TABULATION
	

	Page 2 of 3 
	BIDDERS

	IFB #13-9489-10YD
	Quality 

Uniforms

Co.
	Quality 

Uniforms

Co.
	Best Uniforms, Inc.
	Heroes Apparel, LLC
	
	

	BID DATE:  February 4, 2014

TIME:  2:00 pm
	
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff’s Office 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Item 6: Shirt, Short Sleeve, Women's,  Class A, Fechheimer #176R7884Z   or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	Horace Small
	Leventhal
	As Spec
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	HS1284
	L202Z
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$28.75
	$30.00
	$38.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100
	$2,875.00
	$3,000.0
	$3,800.00
	
	
	

	Item 7 Shirt, Long Sleeve, Men's,  Class A, Fechheimer #33W7884Z  or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	Horace Small
	Leventhal
	As Spec
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	HS1145
	773Z
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$30.75
	$34.99
	$38.50
	
	
	

	Total Price for 250
	$7,687.50
	$8,747.50
	$9,625.00
	
	
	

	Item 8: Shirt, Long Sleeve, Women's, Class A, Fechheimer #126R7884Z  
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	Horace Small
	Leventhal
	As Spec
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	HS1183
	L404Z
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$30.75
	$34.99
	$38.50
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100
	$3,075.00
	$3,499.00
	$3,850.00
	
	
	

	Item 9: Tie, Line Staff, Samuel Broome 45050 or Equal  
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	As Spec.
	As Spec.
	As Spec
	As Spec.
	
	

	Item Number
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$3.75
	$3.75
	$6.00
	4.87
	
	

	Total Price for 125
	$468.75
	$468.75
	$750.00
	$608.75
	
	

	Item 10: Belt, Dutyman Garrison #1611 or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	As Spec.
	As Spec.
	As Spec
	As Spec.
	
	

	Item Number
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$13.00
	$13.00
	$20.00
	$18.11
	
	

	Total Price for 100
	$1,300.00
	$1,300.00
	$2,000.00
	$1,811.00
	
	


	COUNTY OF HENRICO
	IFB:   # 13-9489-10YD 
Annual Contract for Uniforms and Accessories

	BID TABULATION
	

	Page 3 of 3 
	BIDDERS

	Bid #13-9489-10YD
	Quality 

Uniforms

Co.
	Quality 

Uniforms

Co.
	Best Uniforms, Inc.
	Heroes Apparel,
LLC
	
	

	BID DATE:  February 4, 2014 
TIME:  2:00 pm
	
	
	
	
	
	

	DEPT: Sheriff's Office 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Item 11: Sweater, V-Neck, Brown, Blauer #210 or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	Fechheimer
	SAI
	Liberty
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	709
	5953
	140MBN
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$58.00
	$42.00
	$60.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 100
	$5,800.00
	$4,200.00
	$6,000.00
	
	
	

	Item 12: Jacket, Brown, Blauer 6120  or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	As Spec.
	As Spec.
	As Spec
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$105.00
	$105.00
	$110.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 175
	$18,375.00
	$18,375.00
	$19,250.00
	
	
	

	Item 13: Raincoat, Reversible Blauer #26990 or Equal
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Manufacturer
	As Spec.
	As Spec.
	As Spec
	No Bid
	
	

	Item Number
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price
	$87.50
	$87.50
	$120.00
	
	
	

	Total Price for 150
	$13,125.00
	$13,125.00
	$18,000.00
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	TOTAL BID PRICE (Items 1-13)
	$84,176.25
	$85,772.75
	$102,000.00
	$2,419.75
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Addenda 1, 2, 3 and 4
	YES
	YES
	YES
	YES
	
	

	Payment Terms
	Net 30
	Net 30
	Net 30
	Net 30
	
	

	Delivery 
	YES 
	YES
	YES
	YES
	
	


